
RELEASE DATE


13 June 2024



THEME


Egypt, Pyramids, Pharaoh, Golden Spheres



GENERAL INFORMATION


Egypt Sphere: Hold The Spin is a 5 reels and 4 rows video 
slot game with 40 fixed pay lines.


 



PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

Symbols: 5 high pay symbols, 4 low pay symbols, Wild, 
Scatter, Bonus symbols with a random prize ranging from 

1 to 16 times the bet, 4 Jackpot symbols.

http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W


Game Features


Bonus Game with Expand, Collect, and Payer extra wins, 
Free Spins with high pay symbols only and more Bonus 

symbols, Heap of Spheres feature that helps to trigger the 
Bonus game, and 4 Jackpots with max win possibility up 

to x5000 bet. 


Technical information


Game ID: 1061


Game Name: Egypt Sphere: Hold The Spin


RTP: 96%, 92%, 94%, 95%, 


Volatility: Medium-High


Max win: x5000 bet


Support for 18 localizations and social casino standards, 
all types of currencies.


PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W


BONUS GAME


Six or more Bonus symbols anywhere on the reels trigger 
the Bonus Game with 3 spins. Each time a new symbol 

lands, the position becomes locked and the spin counter 
resets to the initial 3 spins. The Bonus Game can be 

triggered in both the main game and Free Spins. Rows 5 
and 6 are inactive at the beginning of the Bonus Game. 
Additional rows unlock when an Expand symbol lands 

during the Bonus Game and activates 1 extra row. 


 On row 5th only Bonus symbols from 10 to 16 times the 
bet, Collect, Expand, Payer, and Jackpot symbols can land. 
On row 6th only Collect, Payer, Jackpot, and special Grand 

symbols can land.



PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W


EXPAND, COLLECT, AND PAYER FEATURES



PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

Expand symbol may appear in Bonus Game only and 
activates 1 extra row. Maximum 2 Expand symbols can 
land during the Bonus Game and upgrade reels up to 6 

rows. After extra row activation, the Expand symbol gets a 
random prize ranging from 1 to 16 times bet or may 

become a Major, Minor, or Mini Jackpot Symbol.

Collect symbol may appear in Bonus Game only and gather 
all the wins from other Bonus symbols currently on reels, 

including other Collect, Expand, Payer, Bonus, and Jackpot 
symbols. 


http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W


Payer symbol may appear only in the Bonus Game and 
increases all the winnings of other Bonus symbols on the 
screen by its value including other Collect, Expand, Payer, 

and Jackpot symbols.


Major, Minor, and Mini Jackpots can be obtained randomly 
in the Bonus Game.


The Grand symbol may appear only on the 6th row 
activated by 2 Expand symbols in the Bonus Game and 

awards the win 5000 times the bet.




PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W


Free Spins


3 Scatter symbols appearing on the 1st, 3rd, and 5th reels 
in the main game activate 10 Free Spins only with high pay, 
Wild, and Bonus symbols on the reels. 3 Scatter symbols 

appearing on the 1st, 3rd, and 5th reels in Free Spins 
activate 5 extra Free Spins.

PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W


HEAP OF SPHERES FEATURE


Any Bonus symbol landing on the reels during the main 
game and Free Spins grants a chance of triggering the 

Heap of Spheres feature, which adds Bonus symbols in a 
quantity enough to activate the Bonus Game.

PLAY DEMO Promo Materials

http://link.gamzix.com/egypt-sphere-hold-the-spin
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1KQXuL6gHeHnkrhaGkMB_rYwuwZvZjI5W

